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DINO

Solid construction made of 
stainless steel AISI 304 totally 
resistant to weather condi-
tions. 

Flexible seat made of rein-
forced belt covered with soft 
rubber, hanged on 6 mm 
stainless steel chains.

Rope ladder steps and rope 
knots made of injection 
molded polyamide.

The seats are made of alu-
minum construction covered 
with a soft EPDM rubber, 
hanged on 6mm stainless 
steel chains. 

Ergonomically-shaped poly-
ethylene rings improving the 
physical well-being and mo-
tor coordination.

   fo edam noitcurtsnoc diloS
black steel S235JR, cleaned 
in the sandblasting process. 
Protected against corrosion 
by galvanizing and powder 
coating with polyester paint 
QUALICOAT attested.  1 –
steel, 2 – sandblasting, 3 – iron 
phosphatizing, 4 – zinc base, 
5 – polyester powder paint. 

Connecting elements like 
screws, nuts, washers made of 
stainless steel. Vandal-proof 
screw plugs made of injection 
molded polyamide.

Back support of the seat with 
steel construction covered 
with soft polyurethane. End-
ings made of polyamide. 

Solid and esthetic rope con-
nectors made of injection 

.edimaylop ded lom

Plates of the walls and plat-
forms made of colourful 13 
mm HPL (black plates made 
of 8 mm HPL), in the highest 
quality, totally damp-proof 
and resistant to UV. 

Attested 6 mm stainless steel 
chains.

Cross connection of ropes 
clamped in sleeves made 
of durable aluminum alloys. 
Used in elements requiring ex-
tremely high strength.

Bended posts made of soft 
conifer wood 9 cm thick, 26 
cm wide and 280 cm long. 
The wood is glued in layers 

   ,seulg enahteruylop htiw
totally resistant to water. 
Wood posts processed in 
three-phased impregnation 
process.

Climbing rocks made of chip-
pings and colourful polyester 
resin.

“Bird nest”  type seat  with 
a diameter of 100 cm, 
hanged on 6 mm stainless 
steel chains. Metal frame 
covered with soft polypropyl-
ene rope. 

Polypropylene ropes pp-multi-
 dna eroc leets a htiw ep yt tilp   s

a diameter of 16 mm.

Plates of the walls made of 
colourful triple layered 15 
mm HDPE polyethylene, in 

   yllatot ,ytilauq  tsehgih eht
damp--proof and  resistant 
to UV.

 dna sro tcennoc fo metsyS
clamps made of strong alu-
minum alloy. Aluminum is 
secured by the process of 
electrophoresis and powder 
coating with polyester paint 
UV resistant and QUALI COAT 
attested.

Rope endings pressed in 
a sleeve made of durable alu-
minum alloy.

Anti-slip anthracite 10 mm 
HPL platform plate with 
a very high resistance to 
weather condi tions and at-
trition.

Swing slings, with double 
bearings, made of stainless 
steel guarantees a quiet 
mechanism operation. Be-
side the horizontal move-
ment it also allows the cir-
cular movement to avoid 
a chain twisting. 

Ends of ropes clamped in 
sleeves made of durable alu-
minum alloys.
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